
His Story 
 
With apologies to Joseph “the Yellow Kid” Weil, John Jacob Factor ranks as one of the 
most successful swindlers of all time. In his heyday, which spanned the era of the 
Roaring Twenties through the 1960s, Factor engineered frauds on both sides of the 
Atlantic, consorted with the Chicago mob, and charmed President John F. Kennedy and 
his “Rat Pack” pals during the golden age of JFK's self-styled “Camelot” regime.   
 
He was a rabbi's son, born Lakow Factrowitz, the youngest of ten children. Jake, as he 
preferred to be called, was born in England but was taken to Lodz, Poland before his first 
birthday where he lived until he was 11 years old.  
 
At the turn of the last century, the family emigrated to St. Louis, Missouri and then on to 
Chicago. Although not illiterate, Factor could barely read or write. “I have,” he said, “a 
hazy recollection of several months of schooling in Poland.”  
 
The family was desperately poor and it was Factor's mother who supported the family in 
hard times through various menial jobs, mostly as a street peddler.  
 
Jake's half brother, Max Factor, eventually made his way out to California and settled in 
West Los Angeles where he found work as a makeup artist with the major studios. Max 
Factor helped invent pancake make-up.  
 
Jake Factor took the low road to success. While still a teenager in the early years of the 
century, he went to work as a barber in his brother's West Side shop, using the money he 
earned to support his parents. Then later, he took at job at Chicago's elegant Morrison 
Hotel, trimming the sideburns of the rich and well born while making important contacts 
that would prove useful to him later in life.   
 
From these humble beginnings, Factor acquired a nickname that would haunt him for the 
rest of his life, a name he hated so much he sometimes paid reporters not to call him 
“Jake the Barber”  Jake abandoned the shop in order to peddle securities in the stock 
market but he was indicted under a federal warrant for stock fraud in 1919. The case was 
closed after he agreed to return the funds, but Factor was indicted again in Florida in 
1922 and 1923, this time for land fraud.  
 
In the next few years there were additional indictments for mail fraud and larceny. He 
participated in a gold mine stock swindle in Canada and another in Rhodesia, but the 
government was never able to seal a conviction in these cases. Jake the Barber returned to 
Chicago, rich enough to live in a 14 room Gold Coast apartment, but still he wanted 
more.  
 
In late 1923, Factor convinced New York's master criminal, Arnold “the Brain” Rothstein 
(the gambling boss who fixed the 1919 World Series), to put up an initial cash investment 
of $50,000 that Factor needed to pull off the largest stock swindle in European history.  
 



Handsome, relaxed and a pleasant sort of man, Factor arrived in London, England in 
early 1924 and began selling worthless penny stocks to gullible British investors with 
great success. He advertised his operation in a publishing venture known as the Broad 
Street Press, which were edited and distributed by Factor's henchmen.   
 
In any successful scam, greed is always the hook. Factor assured the investors a 
guaranteed return of between seven and 12 percent on their initial investments, an 
enormous sum of money in those days compared to the one and two percent normally 
paid out by banks and brokerage houses.  
 
Factor was careful to pay each dividend on demand, but only because he knew his 
trusting investors would generate additional business by spreading the news among their 
friends.   
 
Factor accumulated $1.5 million and skipped town secure in the certain knowledge that 
the bilked victims would not dare file a formal complaint. To do so would reveal their 
stupidity and avarice. Not a single charge was filed against Factor.   
 
Bankrolled by Rothstein, Factor returned to England in early 1925, to pull a second 
deadly scam. At the heart of the swindle was the Tyler Wilson and Company stock 
brokerage firm Factor had invented. After presenting his client list a legitimate stock 
offering called Triplex which sold at $4.00 a share, Factor offered to buy the stock back 
at $6.00 a share, thus earning his victims a quick 50% profit.  A month later, Factor, 
operating through Tyler Wilson, offered another stock called Edison-Bell at $3 a share. 
He quickly bought it back at $6 a share, always careful never to actually deliver the 
stocks certificates to the buyers, because he knew it was a worthless paper transaction. If 
the transactions had been real, Factor stood to lose $750,000.   
 
Established in a luxury suite of rooms in Grosvenor Square, London, Factor sent his 
investors information about two worthless stock certificates, Vulcan Mines and 
Rhodesian Border Minerals, reputed to be lucrative South African gold mining 
companies, which Factor hinted, were on the verge of a big hit.  
 
The Barber sold shares in the companies for as low as 25 cents each, allowing thousands 
of new investors to enter the scam. He then pumped up the earnings up to $2.50 a share.   
 
Tens of thousands of money hungry buyers flooded in, and Jake made sure that each one 
received an unspecified plot of land in Africa, making fraud difficult to detect and prove.   
 
In 1930, English newspapers took note of Factor and his “Ponzi” schemes. There were 
persistent rumors that members of the royal family had invested hundreds of thousands of 
dollars in his phony stocks.  
 
Then, without warning, Jake the Barber closed Tyler Wilson & Co and fled England with 
an estimated 1,619,726 pounds, or about $8,000,000 U.S. dollars, an incredible sum of 
money in the Depression. Jake made one big mistake that would come back to haunt him 



in later years. He returned to the United States by way of Mexico through El Paso, Texas, 
in December of 1930. Factor was admitted back into the United States as a visiting 
immigrant. He swore out a statement that he was born in Hull, England on October 8, 
1892.  
 
The United States Immigration Department already had papers on Jake, sworn out by his 
parents upon their arrival to the States in 1905, that Jake the Barber was a Russian 
national, born in Lodz, Poland on January 10, 1889.  
 
Immigration officials opened a “Factor file,” which they later used to deport him from the 
country.  Meanwhile, the notorious New York beer runner and gangster Jack “Legs” 
Diamond followed Factor's adventures in England with interest, and decided he wanted 
every penny the scam had earned for his narcotics business.  
 
Arnold Rothstein taught Legs Diamond everything there was to know about the narcotics 
racket, molding him into an expert heroin importer.  
 
The drug money made Rothstein careless and lazy, and that was a dangerous position to 
be in, in the volatile world of narcotics smuggling.   
 
Soon others began following the dope trail that Rothstein had blazed. They started to 
hedge in on his territory. What Rothstein refused to surrender to rivals, they took by 
force. One of those takers was Legs Diamond, alleged to have participated in the murder 
of Rothstein at a New York card game in 1928.   
 
With Rothstein disposed, the remnants of his once vast criminal empire were up for 
grabs. Legs Diamond laid claim to Rothstein's European drug smuggling operation, 
import routes and contacts. But laying claim to the routes and controlling them were two 
different issues. Control of the U.S. side of the narcotics market hinged on the money-
earning European hoods that needed to export their dope into the lucrative and insatiable 
American markets.  
 
They wanted to do business with someone who had the cash flow to saturate the states 
with low cost, high quality dope on a continuous basis.   
 
Legs Diamond had the money, in theory, at least. Prohibition had made him rich, but all 
of his cash was tied up in a street war for control of the Manhattan bootleg beer outlets. 
He tried to raise the seed money to enter the narcotics market from different sources, 
including the Mafia. The underworld also knew and understood that Diamond lacked real 
organizational ability and that he drank to excess, and was violent and mentally unstable 
to effectively deal in the sedate and shadowy world of international narcotics trafficking.  
 
With no where else to turn, Diamond sent word to John Factor over in England that he 
was assuming control of all of Rothstein's rackets and demanded his share of the take 
from the stock swindles. Factor never responded, assuming that once Arnold Rothstein, 
his original financier in the scheme was dead and buried, that the proceeds from the 



swindle were his and his alone. Diamond disagreed, and took a luxury liner to England to 
meet with the Barber, but Factor avoided his own execution by simply returning to the 
United States and hiding out in Chicago, enjoying the hospitality of Murray “the Camel” 
Humphreys whom he cut in for a percentage of the take. Factor knew that a killer like 
Legs Diamond didn't give up that easily, especially when millions were at stake. Never a 
violent man, Jake the Barber had enough sense to partner with those who had no aversion 
to violence.  
 
Legs Diamond gave up the chase to attend to his own trial in New York State for 
attempted murder of a competitor. The jury found him not guilty, and that night Diamond 
went out with friends to celebrate. Returning to his room in an Albany, New York 
boarding house in the early morning hours of December 17, 1931, Legs fell into a 
drunken stupor. A half an hour later, two well-dressed men entered Diamond's room and 
pumped three .38 slugs into his head at point-blank range, instantly killing him. 
Murray Humphreys was suspected of engineering the murder, if not committing it 
himself, on behalf of his new business partner, Jake Factor, but the suspicions were never 
proven, nor was there an investigation into the murder. No one seemed to care.  
 
With Diamond out of the way, Jake the Barber emerged from hiding, only to be arrested 
in Chicago on demand of the English government for receiving property known to be 
fraudulently obtained. Factor was freed on a $50,000 bond.  
 
On December 28 1931, the United States Commissioner in Chicago ruled that Factor 
should be extradited to England, where he had already been tried, convicted, and  
sentenced to eight years at hard labor (in absentia).  
 
Factor's lawyers argued unconvincingly that each of his victims had received a small plot 
of land in South Africa, or at least the deed to one, and therefore, no one was swindled.   
 
A federal judge agreed with Factor and over-ruled the Commissioner. The Justice 
Department appealed and the case was on its way for review to the Supreme Court in 
Washington.  
 
It was generally agreed in legal circles that Factor had a weak case and would be 
extradited before the spring. Armed with several million in cash and the best lawyers 
money could buy, the Barber managed to delay his hearing until April of 1933. 
 
Two days before Factor was due to appear before the Supreme Court Jake the Barber's 
son Jerome, was kidnapped in Chicago. A ransom note arrived asking for $50,000. 
Murray Humphreys, the syndicate labor plunderer and Jake the Barber's close friend, led 
the negotiations with the kidnappers from a suite adjoining Factor's room.  
 
Humphreys' role in the kidnapping would have gone unnoticed but the messenger who 
delivered the ransom note was hauled into detective headquarters for questioning and was 
grilled for 45 minutes. When he was released, the young man was swarmed by news 



reporters “I can't talk to you guys,” he said “Murray Humphreys told me to keep my 
mouth shut”   
 
Chicago police raided a suite at the Congress Hotel, which the press dubbed “the 
Hoodlum detective agency,” and arrested the heirs to the Capone syndicate; Murray 
Humphreys, “Machine Gun” Jack McGurn, Sam “Golf Bag” Hunt, Tony Accardo, 
Frankie Rio, Phil D'Andrea, Rocco Di Grazio and a half dozen other mob hangers-on, all 
of whom told the police the same thing: they were there because they had been brought in 
by Murray Humphreys to secure Jerome Factor's safe returned.  
 
The cops locked them up on vagrancy charges, but within an hour Factor posted their bail 
and all were released. While Police were in the apartment they found a ransom note from 
Jerome's kidnappers. When questioned, Factor claimed that he had written the note “to 
confuse the kidnappers”  After eight days in captivity, Jerome Factor was released on a 
Chicago street unharmed. Many people in Chicago simply assumed that Jerome, the good 
son, had agreed to a kidnapping rigged by his father and Murray Humphreys to delay the 
Supreme Court hearing.  
 
With Jerome Factor returned home safely, Jake's appointment to appear before the United 
States Supreme Court was put back on the docket.  
 
Factor was an exceptionally smart and practical man, he knew no matter how many 
shrewd lawyers he could buy, he was going to lose his case before the court and would 
soon be deported.  
 
While discussing his limited options with the attorneys, Factor mentioned the delay in the 
hearing brought about by Jerome's kidnapping.   
 
They reasoned that if Jake were to be kidnapped, and then returned safely to his custody, 
following capture of the kidnappers, then the ensuing trial would be delayed long enough 
for the statute of limitations against him to run out. It wasn't a sure thing, but Jake's 
deportation to a jail cell in England appeared certain.  
 
Factor presented the idea to Murray Humphreys. Frank Nitti signed off on the plan to 
help out his pal, Jake. Humphreys and Nitti, and Paul “the Waiter” Ricca, Nitti's lead 
counsel in the mob, may have already had information that Jerome's kidnapping had been 
pulled off by independents who were employed by Roger “the Terrible” Touhy, a 
bootlegger who was operating out in the Northwest suburbs of Cook County. The Touhy 
gang was small but persistent, and had waged a sporadic war of attrition against the 
Outfit since 1927.   
 
The shrewd and calculating Ricca decided to blame Roger for the kidnapping. After all, 
the mob wasn't having any luck shooting Touhy to death, or blowing him up, which they 
had tried to do on several occasions in the past year. But framing Roger for a kidnapping 
might work, so Nitti gave his approval with the understanding that none of the syndicate 
people were to be involved. Kidnapping without a long-term goal wasn't what the 



Chicago outfit specialized in. They were racketeers by trade. Kidnapping was a dirty 
business, and a high profile crime sure to invite the headline-loving FBI.  
 
In the latter part of August 1942, Roger Touhy, once an important Chicago bootlegger, 
was serving a life sentence for a crime he never committed. Touhy was framed by the 
Capone mob with the apparent connivance of a corrupt Cook County State's Attorney 
named Thomas Courtney, who made political hay out of this page-one conviction. At the 
end of his rope and out of aces, Touhy was desperate to take matters into his own hands.    
 
In 1933, when the international con-man Jake “the Barber” Factor was on the verge of 
extradition back to Great Britain for a raft of stock swindles foisted on overseas investors 
in the 1920s, it was decided to arrange a bogus kidnapping with the help of Frank Nitti, 
boss of the Chicago mob, and heir to Al Capone's empire. Factor was “abducted” outside 
the Dells Roadhouse in suburban Morton Grove, taken to a safe house until a phony 
“ransom” was paid and his release assured.    
 
With the connivance of the Nitti gang, Factor had “fingered” Touhy as his abductor. 
Factor was held by the government as a material witness, just long enough to ensure that 
he would be released under a writ of habeas corpus. U.S. laws required that a person who 
is not extradited within sixty days, be released. Factor's lawyers of course, played the 
percentages and were able to spring their client, who fled to Los Angeles where he 
invested his ill-gotten fortune in real estate.    
 
Virtually every motion Touhy filed to have his case reopened was denied without a 
hearing, despite mounting evidence that proved his innocence.   
 
“I stayed awake until dawn in my cell, thinking,” Touhy wrote. “I was without hope. I 
was buried alive in prison and I would die there. I couldn't see a light ahead anywhere. 
Nothing but darkness, loneliness, and desperation. The world had forgotten me after eight 
years. I was a nothing. Well, there was one way I could focus public attention on my 
misery. I could escape. I would be caught of course but the break would show my terrible 
situation. What cockeyed thinking that was, my mental attitude was a mess, I later came 
to realize.”    
 
The convict who convinced Touhy to escape was Gene O'Connor, a.k.a “James 
O'Connor,” which was another name he used in long criminal career. Actually, his real 
name was Eugene Lathorn, and he was serving a one to life sentence for a May 1932 
robbery-slaying of a Chicago policeman. For O'Connor, prison escape was a way of life. 
By October of 1942 he had already scaled the walls twice.   
 
In 1936, he crept into the Stateville Penitentiary central electric room, pulled the main 
power switch and then scaled the walls to freedom. He was recaptured in January of 1937 
in Kenosha, Wisconsin but escaped again a year later only to be pinched within a week.    
 
Touhy, who was on light work duty as a kitchen steward and clerk, said that O'Connor 
approached him about an escape in the early summer months of 1942.    



 
O'Connor, who had worked with Touhy as a labor slugger back in Chicago, decided the 
time was ripe for escape. The war had taken away most of the younger guards, leaving 
older men, and pensioners left to guard the prisoners.    
 
Since they were being paid starvation wages, O'Connor had primed the pump by bribing 
the tower guards with items lifted from with the prison kitchen storehouse's where Touhy 
worked. The items that were almost impossible to find during war time rationing; 100 
pound sacks of sugar, bags of coffee, slabs of bacon and quarter sides of beef all of which 
could easily be resold on the black market.    
 
Aiding the plan of escape was the fact that E. H. Stubenfield, an old time political hack, 
had replaced the legendary Stateville Warden Joseph Ragen, who had resigned in protest 
over political meddling inside the prison. As a result, the once tight cell-block security 
had gone lax.   
 
The key to the escape were two pistols left at the base of the prison flagpole by Eddie 
Darlak the brother of another inmate who was in on the escape. A trustee had brought 
two guns into the prison wrapped inside in the American flag, which was lowered each 
evening outside the prison walls.   
 
On October 9, 1942, Roger Touhy stood at the prison bakery door inside the kitchen. He 
concealed an enormous pair of scissors stolen from the tailor shop inside of his prison 
issued blue shirt.   
 
Several minutes later, driver Jack Cito, a convict with mob connections, pulled the prison 
laundry truck up to the door. Roger leaped up onto the driver's door and yanked Cito out 
on to the ground and screamed for the keys. When Cito moved too slowly, Touhy cut him 
repeatedly with the scissors, yelling, “Give me the God damn keys!”    
 
Cito told Touhy the keys were in the ignition. Roger leapt into the truck and drove to the 
mechanical shop where the other escapees, O'Connor, McInerney, Darlak, Stewart and 
Nelson were waiting.   
 
O'Connor handed him a.45 automatic pistol and rushed into the mechanical shop where 
he confronted guard Samuel Johnston who asked Touhy “What are you doing here?”   
 
Lost in his thoughts, Touhy didn't answer, but he began snapping the prison telephone 
wires with his long scissors. As Johnston was about to club Touhy into submission, Basil 
“the Owl” Banghart, a Midwestern armed robber and escape artist serving a 99-year 
sentence, came through the window with a pistol at the ready position and ordered 
Johnson to unlock a set of ladders.   
 
At that very moment, guard George Cotter arrived on the scene but was overpowered and 
hrown to the floor.   
 



After placing white hats over the guard's heads, they pushed Cotter and Johnston outside 
orcing them to load the ladders on to the back of the Truck. Touhy ordered them to sit on 
the ladders to keep them from falling off. Then Roger shouted at Stewart, who was 
behind the wheel “OK, go, go go!” Then the truck stalled.   
 
Touhy leaped off the back of the truck, pulled Stewart out of the Driver's seat and tried to 
get the truck started but couldn't. Deciding to jump start the stalled motor, Roger looked 
over to the 300 inmates had crowded around to watch the excitement. Roger yelled for 
the convicts to push the truck, which they did and the motor kicked over with a roar.   
 
The escaping convicts sped across the yard, driving to the Northwest corner to tower 
three. At the base of tower they forced guard Johnston to help them assemble the ladders. 
When he refused, they beat him, tore his shirt off and carted him up the ladder anyway.   
 
Touhy gazed up at the tower and could see the bribed guard standing off to one side, at 
the end of the walkway. “He wasn't holding a gun but he didn't have far to reach for one 
either,” Touhy recalled.    
 
Roger fired a single shot blowing out the guard-house window, and striking the guard in 
the forehead with flying glass.   
 
Before they left the yard, the gang seized two prison-issued high-powered rifles, a pistol, 
and 115 to 200 rounds for each gun, then calmly walked down the tower stairs, leaped 
into Krause's car and roared off towards Chicago.   
 
During the first three days following Touhy's escape, the gang was spotted in the Chicago 
uburbs and additional reports of their presence filtered in from across the United States. 
By the second week, the war news in Europe had crowded them off of the front pages and 
soon the media had forgotten about them.   
 
Through Touhy's contacts on the outside, they were able to rent a large apartment in a run 
down tenement building not far from the Chicago's West Side “Valley” neighborhood, 
where Roger had grown up. There, the escaped cons lived quietly for the next two 
months. In early December, they began to quarrel amongst themselves after Nelson and 
McInerney started drinking and talking about going after women. Roger told them to lay 
low for at least another three months. Nelson didn't like it, he threw a punch that ignited a 
brawl that brought the neighbors banging on the door. The next morning Roger Touhy 
moved into his own flat.   
 
For the first few days, Touhy sat around his small apartment “admiring the loneliness” 
and then he made contact with his brother Eddie who provided him with a bankroll of 
$2,500 and a plan to send him to Arizona but Roger refused to leave Chicago.   
 
Using the money his brother Eddie had provided, and for the negotiated price of $200, 
Roger was also able to purchase a drivers license, social security card and a military draft 
card. It was an absolute must in 1942. The card identified him as “Robert Jackson,” an 



exempt 4-F who worked in a war plant. Touhy purchased a small metal badge that read 
“inspector” which he wore on his lapel.   
 
He bought a used car and spent his days driving through the forest preserves of Chicago 
or going to the movies.    
 
Six weeks went by before he saw Banghart again, the only one who knew where Roger 
lived and came to visit him regularly. During one visit, Banghart asked Roger to come 
over to the apartment for a visit. Since he was lonely and bored, Touhy took him up on 
the offer, sat down for Thanksgiving dinner and decided to move back in shortly 
afterward.   
 
Their reunion didn't go well at all. There were more fisticuffs and a final split. Nelson 
went to Minneapolis where his mother turned him into the FBI just hours after he arrived.   
 
Within minutes after his arrest, Nelson confessed everything he knew about the escapees 
and by nightfall, a small army of agents were slowly and carefully circling the gang's 
apartment hideout.   
 
J. Edgar Hoover arrived on the scene to personally supervise the raid because he felt that 
Touhy had sullied the Bureau's reputation by escaping conviction following the 
prosecution of the kidnappers responsible for the abduction of Minnesota beer-brewing 
tycoon William A Hamm. It was a case built by Special Agent Melvin Purvis back in 
1933. To Hoover, the FBI's capture of Touhy would indemnify the Bureau's bungled 
campaign to put him behind bars in the first place.    
 
Legally, Roger Touhy and his henchmen hadn't done anything wrong. There was nothing 
in the State of Illinois criminal code against felons escaping from prison nor would there 
be until 1949. The FBI, as a federal agency, still had no legitimate grounds to enter into 
the case.   
 
Hoover needed a reason to lock up Touhy so his brain trust decided to create one. At 
length, it was decided that Touhy and the others had violated the federal law requiring all 
men of military age to notify their draft boards that they had changed addresses. The fact 
that Roger was well over the draft age and had already served his country and that the 
others, as convicted felons weren't required to register, were ignored.   
 
The FBI's Chicago office had the entire arrest procedure planned out days in advance 
before Hoover's arrival. Agents and snipers already surrounded the building and 
undercover agents had rented several apartments in the building.   
 
When O'Connor and McInerney came home, six agents, guns drawn, leaped out from 
behind a hallway door. “Put your hands up! We're federal officers”    
 



O'Connor turned, and according to FBI reports, fired his .45 automatic twice. The bullets 
landed into the stair rail. The agents returned fire and pumped at least 35 shells into the 
two convicts.   
 
Touhy and Banghart arrived back at to their apartment about an hour later and went to 
bed.   
 
At the appointed hour, powerful searchlights were trained on the windows of Touhy's 
apartment and then a loud speaker cracked the silence of the night, rousting the fugitives.    
 
“Roger Touhy and the other escaped convicts! The building is surrounded. We are about 
to throw tear gas in the building. Surrender now and you will not be killed”   
 
Banghart wanted to shoot it out, but Touhy said no, forget about it. They were trapped 
and Touhy knew it. They debated what to do for the next ten minutes before Banghart 
shouted replied, “we're coming out”   
 
“Then come out backwards with your hands high in the air! Banghart you come out first”   
 
Banghart, wearing only his pants, appeared at the front door, his back to the agents. 
Touhy, clad in fire engine red pajamas, followed behind.   
 
The agents pounced on them just as soon as they came out of the building and knocked 
them to the cold pavement and handcuffed them. A dozen agents rushed into the 
apartment and found five pistols, three sawed off shotguns, a .30.30 rifle and $13,523 in 
cash which they handed over to the corrupt Dan “Tubbo” Gilbert, the self-serving Chief 
Investigator for State's Attorney Tom Courtney. The cash was instrumental in framing 
Touhy for the kidnapping.  When Gilbert returned the cash to the prisoners at Stateville 
prison, he said that he had only 
been given $800 by the FBI.   
 
After Touhy and Banghart were handcuffed, J. Edgar Hoover, surrounded by a dozen 
agents and newspaper reports, strolled up and said, “Well, Banghart, you're a trapped 
rat.”   
 
The “Owl” burst out into laughter. “You're J. Edgar Hoover aren't you?” he asked.   
 
“Yes,” Hoover beamed “I am he.”   
 
Banghart nodded his head and said, “Your a lot fatter in person then you are on the 
radio.”   
 
A parade of eight cars filled with heavily armed States Attorney's detectives drove them 
back to Stateville. The prisoners were placed in solitary confinement where they survived 
on bread and water with a full meal every third day.   
 



Roger Touhy was taken out of solitary several days later and brought before a judge who 
told him, to his astonishment, that his sentence was now 199 years because under a little 
known Illinois law, a person who aids and abets the escape of a state prisoner will receive 
the same sentence as the prisoner they assisted. The State of Illinois decided that Touhy 
should take on Eddie Darlak's sentence of 100 years.   
 
Roger Touhy was the first prisoner sentenced under that law-life plus 99.    
 
State authorities had enough of Banghart and his death defying escapades. He was 
becoming something of a jailhouse legend. A week after he was returned to Stateville, 
Banghart was hauled out of solitary confinement and shipped off to the island prison at 
Alcatraz. It was a stroke of bad luck for the “Owl”, because although he could fly a plane 
and drive car better and faster then any mere mortal, he had never learned to swim and 
thus was unable to escape from “the Rock.”   
 
Touhy and Banghart were released from prison in 1959 and 1960 respectively. Roger 
Touhy was murdered by vengeful mob assassins on the front porch of his sister's house in 
Chicago's Austin community just twenty-five days after walking through the prison gates. 
Jake Factor was in Chicago at the time, wining and dining his entourage on Rush Street 
when he heard the news. Factor expressed false sympathy when questioned by reporters.   
 
Basil Banghart retired to Washington where he lived out the remainder of his life in 
relative comfort, after inheriting a small fortune from a widowed aunt.   
 
As to the man most responsible for Roger Touhy's collective misfortunes, American 
justice finally played its hand in 1943, though it was probably a moot point to Touhy by 
this time. Jake “the Barber” Factor was sentenced to six years in prison for mail fraud. He 
served his time and was released in 1948. He returned to the West Coast where he made a 
fortune in questionable real estate deals.    
 
In the 1950s, Chicago mob moss Tony Accardo installed Factor as Chicago's “front man” 
at the Stardust Hotel in Las Vegas, a “low roller” casino that was the place to go for 
sports betting. It was an ideal marriage. Factor hustled the celebrities and made his bones 
with the movers and shakers of the nation who passed through Las Vegas.   
 
In 1960 Factor donated a considerable sum to John F. Kennedy's political war chest, 
which earned him a full presidential pardon in 1962 from the grateful Kennedys. Factor 
continued to curry the favor of national political leaders like Hubert Humphrey and 
Richard Nixon up until the moment of his death in 1984. He is buried in Hollywood not 
far from the show business celebrities he had entertained in real life. 


